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About the Book

In Lens On Outdoor Learning, veteran educator Wendy Banning shares her
passion for outdoor learning and provides K-12 teachers with the essential
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tools and strategies to effectively implement it in their classrooms,
regardless of their location or climate. With its engaging and accessible
approach, Lens On Outdoor Learning is an invaluable resource for
educators seeking to connect students with the natural world and foster a
lifelong love of learning.

Banning begins by exploring the many benefits of outdoor learning,
including its ability to improve student engagement, academic
achievement, and social-emotional development. She then provides a step-
by-step guide to planning and implementing outdoor learning experiences,
from choosing the right location and activities to managing risk and
assessment.

Banning also includes a wealth of resources and case studies from
educators who have successfully implemented outdoor learning in their
classrooms. These examples provide valuable insights and inspiration for
teachers who are new to outdoor learning or who are looking for new ways
to improve their existing programs.

With its comprehensive coverage of the topic, Lens On Outdoor Learning is
an essential resource for K-12 teachers who want to bring the benefits of
outdoor learning to their students.

Reviews

“Wendy Banning has written a comprehensive and inspiring guide to
outdoor learning. Lens On Outdoor Learning is packed with practical tips
and strategies that will help teachers of all levels implement outdoor
learning experiences in their classrooms.”



—Dr. Richard Louv, author of Last Child in the Woods and Vitamin N

“Lens On Outdoor Learning is a valuable resource for educators who want
to connect their students with the natural world. Wendy Banning provides a
wealth of information and inspiration that will help teachers create
meaningful and engaging outdoor learning experiences.”

—Jennifer Serravallo, author of The Reading Strategies Book and The
Writing Strategies Book

“Lens On Outdoor Learning is an essential guide for K-12 teachers who
want to bring the benefits of outdoor learning to their students. Wendy
Banning provides a clear and concise overview of the research on outdoor
learning, as well as practical tips and strategies for implementing it in the
classroom.”

—Dr. Stephen Kellert, author of Biophilic Design and Nature by
Design

About the Author

Wendy Banning is a passionate advocate for outdoor learning and has
been teaching for over 20 years. She has taught in a variety of settings,
including traditional classrooms, outdoor classrooms, and nature schools.
She is currently the Director of Outdoor Education for the Portland Public
Schools in Oregon.

Banning is a frequent speaker and writer on the topic of outdoor learning.
She has presented at conferences and workshops around the world, and



her work has been featured in numerous publications, including Education
Week, The New York Times, and The Washington Post.

Banning is also the author of The Outdoor Classroom Handbook and
Nature Play: A Guide for Parents and Educators.
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Lens On Outdoor Learning is an essential resource for K-12 teachers who
want to connect their students with the natural world and foster a lifelong
love of learning. With its comprehensive coverage of the topic, engaging
and accessible approach, and wealth of resources, Lens On Outdoor
Learning is a must-read for any educator who wants to bring the
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